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Remember: Printable 
versions to share found at 
http://afaofpa.org/weekly-
newsletter/   
 
Check Our Recent Interview 
http://afaofpa.org/listen/ 
 
News From Around PA  
The 3rd Circuit Court of 
Appeals said the owners of 
Lancaster, County-based 
Conestoga, a cabinet-making 
company, could not 
challenge the Obamacare 
mandate because of their 
personal religious beliefs.   

Groups from at least two 
Christian schools, Eastern 
University in PA and George 
Fox University in OR, have 
formed OneEastern and 
OneGeorgeFox.  The groups'  
wants GLBT students to "feel 
affirmed in their sexuality." 

State Senator Daylin Leach, 
is aiding the Montgomery 
County Register of Wills', 
efforts in promoting 'gay' 
marriage by officiating at 
same-sex "marriages."  He is 
a registered officiant with 
the Universal Life Church.  
Senator Leach has 
introduced SB 719 which 

would legalize same-sex 
"marriage" in PA.  He is also a 
candidate for the Democratic 
nomination for Congress for 
the 13th District which will 
be an open seat as 
Congresswoman Allyson 
Schwartz is seeking the Dem 
nomination for governor. 

News from National Scene  
The General Assembly of the 
Christian Church (Disciples 
of Christ) has joined with 
several other oldline 
Protestant denominations in 
embracing sexual orientation 
and gender identity as 
specially affirmed categories 
in the church. 

In Chicago, a National Gay & 
Lesbian Sports Hall of Fame 
has opened.  Dave Pallone, 
Martina Navratilova, Billie 
Jean King, Greg Louganis, 
and Jason Collins were 
honored in the first class of 
inductees.  It has also been 
announced that a number of 
the inductees who are not 
"gay" are being recognized 
for having "helped create 
safe environment for LGBTs 
to compete in sports at every 
level." 

Tom Wheeler, President 
Obama's nominee to head 
the Federal Communications 

Commission, hinted during 
confirmation hearings that 
he would support voluntary 
efforts to clean-up the 
content of broadcast 
television rather than 
cracking down with steep 
fines.  

Cause of Action is asking the 
IRS to review the tax-exempt 
status of a organization 
crucial in helping to promote 
ObamaCare.  It says Enroll 
America Enroll America 
should not have received tax-
exempt status because its 
work helps secure new 
customers for insurance 
companies.________________ 
AFA of PA encourages 
Christians, through education, 
to become involved in pro-
family issues in their 
community, state and the 
nation. 
We are a non-profit 
organization that is totally 
dependent upon financial gifts 
from our supporters.  You can 
give online here 
http://afaofpa.org/donate/   
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