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Check Our Recent Interview  
Robert Knight - ACRU - 
Voting Integrity or Not? 
http://afaofpa.org/listen/  

News From Around PA 
A federal judge ruled the Ten 
Commandments monument 
outside Connellsville Area 
Junior High School violated 
the First Amendment.   
However, he did not order it 
removed because those who 
were "offended" by the 
monument have moved from 
the district.  Seeking to 
prevent another lawsuit, the 
school  moved the Ten 
Commandments to a 
neighboring church property.  
In its previous location, it 
was seen by very few people. 
It now sits next to a driveway 
visible to anyone 
approaching the high school! 

Philadelphia is removing 
"Men" and "Women" labels 
from single occupancy public 
restrooms.  Transgender 
activists  say it "is a small 
step in eliminating 
harassment/discrimination 

of transgender people."  
Businesses have 90 days to 
comply or face a fine. 

Moody's Investor Services 
has downgraded PA's general 
obligation bond outlook to 
“negative,” citing PA's 
“extreme political gridlock.” 

The American Democracy 
Legal Fund claims PA 
Congressman Ryan Costello 
(PA-6) and 22 other 
Republican Congressmen 
violated House rules by 
agreeing to outline their 
legislative agendas to the 
National Republican 
Campaign Committee in 
exchange for financial 
support. 

House Gaming Oversight 
Committee Minority 
Chairman Nick Kotik, D-
Allegheny, wants to carve 
out an exemption under the 
federal Professional and 
Amateur Sports Protection 
Act to allow wagering on 
professional sports in PA. 

News from National Scene 
Concerning the race for 
House Speaker, Democrat PA 
Congressman Brendan Boyle 
said "It's now time for 
Democrats and normal 
Republicans to come 

together and jointly elect a 
Speaker - my pick is Charlie 
Dent."  Dent is a liberal 
Republicans from the 
Allentown area.  Dent has 
also indicated Republicans 
should work with Democrats 
to elect a new Speaker. 

Planned Parenthood has  
announced that it will no 
longer accept money for 
donating baby body parts to 
medical research.  They'll 
now do it for free and they 
think that will fix the 
problem!  They are still 
ripping babies apart! 

California has become the 
third state to legalize 
physician-assisted suicide.   

Chick-fil-A has opened its 
first restaurant in NYC.  

We are a non-profit organization 
that is totally dependent upon 
financial gifts from our 
supporters.  You can give online 
here http://afaofpa.org/donate/   
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