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Check Our Recent Interview  
http://afaofpa.org/listen 
 
News From Around PA 
Easton City Councilman 
Mike Fleck will be honored 
by the homosexual group 
Pennsylvania Diversity 
Network for his sponsorship 
of last year's domestic 
partnership law. 

Warminster (Bucks County) 
will hold “Safe Pride: A 
Commitment in Blood” from 
10 a.m.-5 p.m. May 12 at 263 
Marketplace, 700 York Road.  
The proceeds will go to help 
benefit the AIDS Fund.  Safe 
Pride creator Dr. Natalie 
Beech said, “Warminster has 
never had a Pride event. 
We’re surrounded by three 
places that all support the 
LGBT community and do 
their own Pride celebrations 
— New Hope, Doylestown 
and Hatboro. But this has 
never happened here in 
Warminster.”  The event is 
also to be 'educational,' but 
will the truth be told?  In the 

most recent CDC stats 
available (2009) men who 
have sex with men continued 
to be the majority of new 
AIDS cases with about 61 
percent, or 29,300 cases.    

Merit selection of appellate 
judges - HB 1815 and HB 
1816 - was  introduced last 
year. Recently a public 
hearing was held in Philly.  
"Pennsylvanians for Modern 
Courts" say this is the best 
way to go -- take choosing 
judges out of the hands of 
voters and put it into the 
hands of the Governor and  
an Appellate Court 
Nominating Commission  
partially filled by the 
Governor's appointees! So, 
should the voters have a say? 

New from National Scene 
A new survey of Fortune 100 
companies finds that under 
Obamacare it will be cheaper 
for a company to drop 
employee coverage.  Even 
after paying a penalty of 
$2,000 per employee, the 
companies stand to save 
$28.6 billion in 2014 alone by 
shifting employees to health 
insurance exchanges 
governed by federal regs. 

President Obama endorsed 
same-sex "marriage" on May 

9th.  He said he was 
compelled by the Golden 
Rule to allow homosexuals to 
"marry."  Maybe he should 
read Matthew 19 to see 
what Jesus had to say about 
marriage! The US House has 
now taken steps to block 
federal funds from being 
used to violate DOMA, ban 
same-sex "marriages" on 
military bases and protect 
the rights of chaplains and 
military personnel who 
oppose homosexuality.____ 
AFA of PA encourages 
Christians, through 
education, to become 
involved in pro-family issues 
in their community, state 
and the nation. 
We are a non-profit 
organization that is totally 
dependent upon financial 
gifts from our supporters.  
You can give online here 
http://afaofpa.org/donate/   
Follow us Twitter & 
Facebook 
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