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News From Around PA 
New Jersey Congressman 
Chris Smith says the 
investigation into the 
University of Pittsburgh’s use 
of  baby body parts in 
research was a whitewash.  It 
did not address many 
questions including whether 
U Pitt used the body parts of 
babies who were born alive 
and died when their organs 
were harvested.   

Nine of Pennsylvania’s 
seventeen freestanding 
abortion clinics failed at least 
one inspection last year.  Six 
of those were Planned 
Parenthood facilities.   

Annual abortions in PA have 
increased 7 percent since 
2017 -- 88 abortions per day.  

The University of 
Pennsylvania admitted that 
the Pfizer/BioNTech and 
Moderna COVID 19 mRNA 
vaccines both use licensed U 
Penn technology.   Thus, U 
Penn, Dr. Weissman and Dr. 
Kariko have received 
significant financial benefit in 
the sale of these products. 

Dr. David Prentice, the vice 
president of the Charlotte 

Lozier Institute and a medical 
researcher, said the 
University of Pittsburgh 
investigation, which was 
commissioned by the 
university, was too narrow.  
He also noted that there is no 
need to use unethically 
obtained tissue from aborted 
babies in scientific research. 

News From National Scene 
Adidas tweeted an ad for 
sports bras showing 25 pairs 
of bare breasts.  Responding 
to critics they said, “We want 
to celebrate bodies in all their 
glory and proudly showcase 
how different we are.”   

TikTok has updated its 
“hateful ideologies” 
guidelines and now bans 
"deadnaming, misgendering, 
or misogyny as well as 
content that supports or 
promotes conversion therapy 
programs.”  Deadnaming is 
using the former given name 
of an individual who now 
identifies as transgender.   

8th Grade students in Enfield, 
CT were given an assignment 
about pizza!  They were told 
to pick pizza toppings 
describing their sexual “likes” 
and “dislikes” i.e. cheese = 
kissing; olives = giving oral. 
Parents voiced their outrage 
during the recent school 

board meeting and tended 
not to accept the 
superintendent’s excuse that 
the assignment was posted 
by accident. 

Dr. Anthony Fauci’s National 
Institute of Allergy and 
Infectious Diseases funds 
nearly 80% of taxpayer-
funded NIH research 
involving preborn baby parts.  

Porn giant MindGeek’s 
motion to dismiss child sex 
abuse survivors’ lawsuit has 
been denied.  

LGBT activist Sam Brinton, 
who has a puppy fetish, was 
recently hired by the Biden 
administration to oversee the 
disposal of nuclear waste.   

The Moses Brown Lower 
School in Providence, RI has 
“recommended” that student 
avoid giving their peers 
Valentine’s Day cards that 
portray “only white people.” 
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