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News from Around PA 
Mark Paterson, professor of 
sociology at the University of 
Pittsburgh, recently 
expressed concern over the 
lack of diversity among the 
robot population.  Paterson 
worries, for example, that 
black children “could end up 
interacting with white 
robots.” 

 In 1985 the PA Supreme 
Court upheld a law banning 
the use of state Medicaid 
dollars for abortion, except 
in cases of rape, incest or to 
save the life of the mother.  
Now in a 3-2 decision the 
court revived a challenge to 
the law saying a lower court 
must hear a challenge to its 
constitutionality.   

The Human Rights Campaign, 
the nation’s largest LGBTQ 
lobbying group, recently 
issued its “State Equality 
Index”, a comprehensive 
“state-by-state report that 
provides a review of 
statewide laws and policies 
that affect LGBTQ+ people 
and their families.”  
Pennsylvania came in 25th. 

Moriarty’s Irish Pub on 
Walnut Street in Philly has 
been reported to the 
Philadelphia Commission on 
Human RelaƟons for violaƟng 
the Fair PracƟces Ordinance 
for placing an ad looking for a 
“biologically male” bartender. 
The pub is located in the 
Gayborhood and the owner’s 
acƟons have been deemed 
‘transphobic’.   

News From NaƟonal Scene 
The track and field records for 
the Rochester InsƟtute of 
Technology were recently 
broken – by a “transgender 
female”, a biological male. 
Last year he ran the same 
course in the men’s race and 
came in 19th.  Since then, he 
“decided” he was really a 
female and has now 
destroyed the 200 and 300 
meter women’s records! 

The project, “Improving the 
Accessibility of Transgender 
Voice Training with Visual-
acoustic Biofeedback,” aims 
to improve “gender-affirming 
voice and communication 
training (GAVT” with “novel 
GAVT software” that coaches 
men on their “pitch and 
resonance” through voice 
exercises.  Guess what?? The 
project, led by a transgender 
professor, received a NIH 
grant for $213,878 in 

taxpayer funds for the effort. 
The federal agency lists the 
project as “research related 
to deafness and 
communication disorders”, 
but has failed to answer how 
that description applies! 

Utah Governor Spencer Cox  
signed legislaƟon that bans 
DEI programs in the state 
government and public 
universiƟes.  He also signed a 
law that bans boys who 
idenƟfy as girls from entering 
girls’ private spaces.   

University of Colorado 
Boulder Theatre Professor 
Beth Osnes fights her 
“climate anxiety” by dressing 
and performing as a buƩerfly!   
She also teaches  
environmental studies classes 
and became “increasingly 
discouraged about the 
perilous state of our planet.” 
We are a non-profit organizaƟon 
that is totally dependent upon 
financial giŌs from our supporters.  
You can give online 
hƩps://afaofpa.org/donate/   
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