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versions to share found at 
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Check Our Recent Interview 
Guest:  Andy Schlafly 
Topic: Danger of Article V 
Convention of States  
News From Around PA 
A family had rented the 
Prince of Peace Parish Hall in 
Pittsburgh for a fundraiser - a 
Drag Queen Bingo!   Upon 
approval of the rental, the 
parish did not know all the 
details i.e. the drag queen 
part!  The event has since 
been cancelled and the parish 
is taking donations for the 
little girl with cancer for 
which the event was 
originally planned.  Donations 
can be made to:  
Chelsi Kennedy  
Prince of Peace Parish  
81 S 13th Street  
Pittsburgh, PA 15203  
 
A Dunkin’ Donuts in 
Bethlehem has asked a 
federal judge to dismiss an 
antibias lawsuit brought by a 
former employee - a 
“transgender woman,” really 
a biological male.  During the 
three months he was 
employed he claims he was 
misgendered and prevented 

from using the women’s 
bathroom after a customer 
complained.  FYI: Previously 
Bethlehem passed a LGBT 
special protection ordinance.   
 
The medical provider for the 
Lackawanna County prison 
seeks dismissal of two federal 
lawsuits filed by transgender 
inmates who allege they were 
denied hormone therapy. 

News From National Scene 
Lawmakers in Georgia, 
Tennessee and Washington 
have proposed legislation 
that would place restrictions 
on  boys in girls’ sports, etc. 
 

Acting Secretary of the Dept. 
of Homeland Security 
ordered a review of state 
laws allowing illegal aliens to 
obtain driver’s licenses.  

The Trump administration 
issued 2,964 final rules in 
2019.  This is the lowest count 
since records started being 
kept in the mid-70’s.  Some of 
those ‘rules’ are written to 
get rid of or replace others! 

The United Methodist 
Church has officially 
announced it will be splitting 
over the homosexual issue.   
Those who hold Biblical 
understanding of sex and 
marriage will form a new 

denomination.  Thus the left-
wing faction will not face 
sanctions and all  local UMC 
churches will  have to vote to 
identify as “traditionalist 
Methodists.”   

In Utah a  bill that banned 
talk therapy for minors with 
unwanted same-sex 
attraction failed to make it 
through the House.  However 
the GOP governor has 
implemented regulatory 
language based on the 
language of the failed bill! 

First Energy Foundation has 
given grants of $5,000 or 
$10,000 to fourteen non-
profits, one of which is 
Equality Toledo, which 
pushes the LGBTQ agenda in 
the Toledo area. 

Gender-confused Jazz 
Jennings “proudly” showed 
off his “transition scars” in a 
New Year’s Eve photo. 
Remember he’s the subject of 
the children’s book I Am Jazz. 
We are a non-profit organization 
that is totally dependent upon 
financial gifts from our supporters.  
You can give online 
https://afaofpa.org/donate/   
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