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Remember: Printable 
versions to share found at 
https://afaofpa.org/weekly-
newsletter/   
Check Our Recent Podcast: 
Rev. Bill Owens-Coalition of 
African-American Pastors; 
What Would Dr. King Think? 
News From Around PA 
Allentown’s Bradbury-
Sullivan LGBT Community 
Center has joined other 
LGBTQ groups in suing the 
Trump administration for 
correctly interpreting the 
word ‘sex’ in the anti-
discrimination clause in 
Obamacare!  The Obama 
administration had redefined 
‘sex’ to include those who 
identify as LGBTQ - meaning 
hormones and sex change 
surgery would be covered 
under Obamacare. 

Philadelphia-area LGBTQ 
leaders  recently held a press 
call discussing President 
Trump’s “continual attempts 
to sabotage LGBTQ rights.”  
The group included 
Democratic Party LGBTQ 
Caucus Chair Sean Meloy, PA 
State Representative Brian 
Sims, Erie City School Board 
Vice President Tyler Titus, 
community health organizer 
and trans activist Deja Lynn 
Alvarez, LGBTQ business and 

political advocate Jonathan 
Lovitz, and Anne 
Wakabayashi, chair of the PA 
Comm.  on LGBTQ Affairs.   

Scott Township (Allegheny 
County) Commissioner Paul 
Abel resigns after he and his 
family are harassed by LGBTQ 
activists because during a 
meeting he expressed 
frustration over the COVID-19 
restrictions and said, “I’m 
tired of listening to a guy 
dressed up like a woman,” 
referring PA Health Secretary 
Levine. 

News From National Scene 
A yearlong investigation by 
the US Department of 
Education has unearth $1 
billion in anonymous foreign 
funding on campuses 
nationwide.  In fact, one 
school had direct contracts 
with the Chinese Communist 
Party!  A previously released 
Senate subcommittee report 
found foreign countries “seek 
to exploit America’s 
openness to advance their 
own national interests” and 
“the most aggressive of them 
has been China.” 

The U.S. Justice Department 
is backing Idaho’s Fairness in 
Women’s Sports Act against 
a legal challenge made on 

behalf of male athletes who 
identify as female and want 
to compete against women. 

Calvin Klein has introduced 
the first ‘transgender 
lesbian.”  To be specific:  their 
first Black transqueer model 
as part of this year’s Pride 
campaign. 

More and more children of 
Hollywood celebrities are 
announcing they are 
transgender.  Most recently 
Walking Dead actor Khary 
Payton announced his 11-
year-old biological daughter 
is now his transgender son! 

The words 'This is a childhood 
development disorder,' 
spoken during a panel 
discussion titled “Summit on 
Protecting Children from 
Sexualization” were all it took 
for YouTube to call it “hate 
speech” and remove the 
entire three-hour video of the 
panel discussion. 
We are a non-profit organization 
that is totally dependent upon 
financial gifts from our supporters.  
You can give online 
https://afaofpa.org/donate/   
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