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News from Around PA 
The ACLU has filed a 
complaint with the  US DOE 
Office for Civil Rights and the 
DOJ’s Civil Rights Division on 
behalf of seven transgender 
and non-binary students in 
the Central Bucks School 
District claiming illegal 
gender discrimination.  

After facing backlash for 
placing a teacher on 
administrative leave for not 
using preferred pronouns, 
the board of South Side 
School District (Beaver 
County) held a special vote to 
remove the policy. They also 
voted to reinstate Daren 
Cusato to the school's staff. 
The board says it plans to 
write a new preferred 
pronoun policy. 

It has recently been revealed 
that the current Acting PA 
Secretary of Education, Eric 
Hagarty, as well of Governor 
Tom Wolf’s Deputy Chief of 
Staff received emails from 
the US DOE Office of 
Communications and 
Outreach back in August 
2021.  The emails showed 
how the Biden 
Administration would use 

school sports and other extra-
curricular activities as 
leverage to “convince” 
parents that their child must 
get the COVID vaccine to be 
allowed to fully participate in 
school activities. 

News From National Scene 
USC’s Annenberg Inclusion 
Initiative, which has ties to 
Walt Disney Studios, has 
announced the 
“Reproductive Rights 
Accelerator” program. It will 
award at least three seniors a 
$25,000 grant toward the 
script development and 
creation of films about the 
issue of “abortion rights”.  

Remember Jack Phillips of 
Masterpiece Cakeshop in 
Colorado?  Well, he’s back in 
court to protect his First 
Amendment rights.  In 2018, 
the very day the US Supreme 
Court ruled in his favor over a  
cake celebrating same-sex 
‘marriage’. A trans activist 
called the shop requesting a 
custom-designed cake, pink 
on the inside and blue on the 
outside, that would 
symbolize and celebrate a 
gender transition.  Phillips 
declined and was 
immediately sued! 
A Doernbecher Children’s 
Hospital-produced guide to 

“safe tucking,” a practice 
used by those who identify as 
transgender that “makes the 
genital area look smoother 
and flatter” by “moving the 
penis, testicles, or both out of 
the way” was passed out at 
the Burbank Pride Parade.  
The Portland, OR children’s 
hospital also produces a 
‘chest binding’ guide that 
involves “wrapping some- 
thing around your chest to 
flatten your breasts” in order 
for a woman to look more 
masculine. 

A California daycare teacher 
was fired allegedly for not 
reading books about same-
sex marriage to young 
students between the ages of 
one and five. The center’s 
policy requires all teachers 
“to support and promote 
celebrations of ‘diversity’ 
including same-sex marriage 
to children in the program.” 
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